
Margaretta Local Schools Student Wellness & Success Plan

Tier 1 Support

● Provided by School Counselor
● Curriculum and training supplied

through ADAMHS board grants:
ROX & Sources of Strength

● Can refer to Erie County Health
Department or Family Health
Services, in addition to other
community providers, as deemed
necessary. List of providers
shared with parents as requested.

● Services are free of cost to all
students and available daily.

Tier 2 Support

● Provided by Erie County Health
Department (community partner)

● School Nurse serves as the first
line of defense. Can refer to
community providers or for
additional community based
services through the local health
department. Can help link to
agencies covered by insurance.

● Provides general physical health
monitoring for all students in
school setting with individual
general practitioners at the clinic.

● Services are free of cost at the
School Nurse level. Nurse will
work with providers for appropriate
insurance coverage and Erie
County Health Department
accepts all forms of insurance and
Medicaid.

Tier 3 Support

● Provided by Family Health
Services (mental health treatment
provider)

● Certified Social Worker/Therapist
provides direct services to child.
Can refer to specialized
community provider through FHS
such as pediatric psychiatry or
general practitioner services.

● Provides general practitioner
services for wellness checkups,
illness, and other physical health
complaints.

● Family Health Services will work
with families regarding insurance
coverage and FHS accepts all
forms of insurance and Medicaid.


